
From: Rouse, Mathew
To: R4_Regional_Hearing_Clerk
Subject: Payment Confirmation TSCA-04-2023-3105(b)
Date: Thursday, December 14, 2023 11:26:26 AM

Good morning,
 
Please see payment confirmation for CHM Real Estate, LLC.
 
-Mathew
404-562-8522
 

From: charlie malone <charliemalone1@gmail.com> 
Sent: Wednesday, December 13, 2023 12:40 PM
To: Rouse, Mathew <Rouse.Mathew@epa.gov>
Subject: Confirmation of Dec payment from Charlie Malone re: 109 Peggy Dr Clarksville TN 37042
 
Caution: This email originated from outside EPA, please exercise additional caution when deciding whether to open attachments or click on provided
links.
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Sent from my iPhone


